

Mary Claire Fischer Attorney at Law

January 16, 2006 Via First Class Mail

Andrew D. Kirch SOSDG/AHBL 5707 Indianola Ave Indianapolis, IN 46220

RE:

CAUSE NO. 2005-CI-19492; RICHARD M. SCOVILLE, ET AL., VS. BRIAN J. BRUNS, ET AL, IN THE 45TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF BEXAR COUNTY, TEXAS

Dear Andrew:

We enclose the hard copy of Invoice No. 1001, dated January 16, 2006. This is the hard copy of the invoice previously forwarded to you via email.

As we discussed, I would greatly appreciate the additional posting you said you would make on your internet site related to collection of the final fees for the Scoville matter. Also, as we discussed, Brian never did forward the check to me as promised. I do not have his email in front of me, but I believe the check was somewhere in the \$300.00 range.

It has been delightful to work with you, feel free to call me anytime and keep me posted on Mr. Scoville's activities. Should he serve me with any additional motions, requests or documents related to the litigation, I will contact you immediately.

Sincerely,

Mary Claire Fischer



Mary Claire Fischer Attorney at Law

Andrew D. Kirch SOSDG/AHBL 5707 Indianola Ave Indianapolis, Indiana 46220

January 16, 2006 Client Matter No. 0731.001 Invoice No. 1001

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES:

| DATE | | DESCRIPTION | TIME | AMOUNT |
|----------|-----|--|-------|----------|
| 12/27/05 | JT | Multiple telephone conferences with Mr. Kirch regarding information related to Mr. Scoville's lawsuit in Bexar County. | 0.30 | 7.50 |
| 12/27/05 | MCF | Review documents drafted by Mr. Kirch as basis for Special Appearance and Motion to Dismiss, factual information for supporting affidavit; online research for Texas caselaw supporting a Special Appearance; telephone conference with Mr. Kirch to discuss and develop strategy for Special Appearance and Court Appearance at Temporary Injunction hearing; draft Affidavit for Mr. Kirch; draft Defendant's Special Appearance; draft Answer subject to Special Appearance; prepare to file and serve pleadings and appear at hearing to postpone Injunction Hearing and set hearing for Special Appearance; multiple telephone conferences with Mr. Kirch; Online Westlaw research regarding federal "Good Samaritan statute; review postings on AHBL regarding lawsuit and Scoville posting regarding to contributors to defense funds as co-conspirators. | 10.50 | 1,837.50 |

Mr. Andrew Kirch SOSDG/AHBL January 16, 2006 Page 2 of 7

| DATE | | DESCRIPTION | TIME | AMOUNT |
|----------|-----|--|------|--------|
| 12/28/05 | MCF | Appear in Presiding Court for announcement on Special Appearance and "not ready" announcement on Injunction Hearing; appear before Judge Gabriel to argue that Special Appearance should be set for hearing prior to Injunction Hearing as well as basic jurisdictional argument and "not ready" announcements on Injunction Hearing; confer with Mr. Scoville regarding date to set Special Appearance for hearing and date to extend Temporary Restraining Order; copy subpoenas issued by Mr. Scoville; telephone conference with Mr. Scoville. | 4.50 | 787.50 |
| 12/29/05 | MCF | Correspondence from Mr. Scoville regarding Order on extension of Temporary Restraining Order; telephone conference with Mr. Scoville; further research and outline of caselaw for hearing on Special Appearance. | 3.80 | 665.00 |
| 01/02/06 | JT | Online Westlaw research for Special Appearance hearing and potential Injunction hearing; begin construction of caselaw notebooks for Ms. Fischer's use in preparation for Special Appearance Hearing and potential Injunction Hearing. | 6.10 | 152.50 |
| 01/02/06 | MCF | Draft order setting hearing on Special Appearance; correspondence to Mr. Scoville regarding hearing on Special Appearance and response to his correspondence of December 29, 2005; review emails and other information forwarded by Mr. Kirch. | 3.90 | 682.50 |

Mr. Andrew Kirch SOSDG/AHBL January 16, 2006 Page 3 of 7

| DATE | | DESCRIPTION | Тіме | AMOUNT |
|----------|-----|---|------|----------|
| 01/03/06 | MCF | Telephone conference with Mr. Kirch; begin detailed review of caselaw and outline of argument for hearing on Special Appearance; correspondence to Mr. Scoville. | 2.10 | 367.50 |
| 01/03/06 | JT | Telephone conference with Mr. Scoville regarding correspondence; telephone conference with MBC Couriers; continue construction and organization of caselaw notebooks for Ms. Fischer's use in preparation for Special Appearance Hearing; draft proposed Orders in Defendants' Special Appearance. | 4.50 | 112.50 |
| 01/04/06 | JT | Online Westlaw research; organize and review caselaw; construction of hearing notebooks and preparation of hearing materials; correspondence to Mr. Scoville; multiple telephone attempts to reach Mr. Kirch; revisions to Order on Defendants' Special Appearance. | 8.10 | 202.50 |
| 01/04/06 | MCF | Review Plaintiffs' Original Petition and Application for Temporary Restraining Order and Preliminary and Permanent Injunction in detail; continue reviewing case law for Special Appearance Hearing; draft Outline of Argument for Special Appearance Hearing; prepare cases to tender to Court during argument; correspondence to Mr. Scoville enclosing conformed copies of Orders; correspondence to Mr. Scoville regarding providing Mr. Kirch with pleadings and correspondence in the case; Online research for additional case law related to jurisdictional requirements. | 7.50 | 1,312.50 |

Mr. Andrew Kirch SOSDG/AHBL January 16, 2006 Page 4 of 7

| DATE | | DESCRIPTION | TIME | AMOUNT |
|----------|-----|---|-------|----------|
| 01/05/06 | MCF | Appear in Presiding Court for Special Appearance Hearing; review and research authority and arguments in Mr. Scoville's Response to Special Appearance; review and research the law regarding Mr. Scoville's Emergency Ex Parte Motion for Contempt and Motion for Sanctions; appear before Judge Mireles to Argue Special Appearance; Draft witness question for Mr. Scoville's witnesses during hearing recess; appear before Judge Specia and continue argument of Special Appearance, cross examine Mr. Scoville's first three witnesses; prepare for continuation of Special Appearance hearing and cross examination of Mr. Scoville's two final witnesses; prepare short closing statement and outline specific cases to argue to the court regarding Mr. Scoville's failure to carry burden of establishing jurisdiction to overcome Special Appearance; revise proposed Orders sustaining Special Appearance, with prejudice to refiling case in Texas | 12.80 | 2,240.00 |
| 01/05/06 | JT | Assist Ms. Fischer during Special Appearance Hearing. | 11.50 | 287.50 |
| 01/06/06 | MCF | Appear before Judge Specia for remainder of Special Appearance Hearing; cross-examine Mr. Scoville's final witnesses; present closing argument and authority to the Court and secure Judge signature on Order Sustaining Defendants' Special Appearance; telephone conference with Mr. Kirch | 4.50 | 787.50 |
| 01/06/06 | JT | Assist Ms. Fischer during Special Appearance Hearing. | 4.50 | 112.50 |

PROFESSIONAL RATES AND SERVICES:

| MCF | Mary Claire Fischer, Attorney - \$175/hour | 49.60 | 8,680.00 |
|-------------|--|------------|----------|
| | (Reduced Rate) | | |
| JT | Juli Tanner, Paralegal - \$25.00/hour | 35.00 | 875.00 |
| | (Reduced Rate) | | |
| TOTAL HOURS | 84.60 | \$9,555.00 | |

ADDITIONAL CHARGES:

COPY CHARGES

01/04/06

| COLLCIA | ANGES | | | |
|----------|---------------------------------|--------|-----------------------|--------|
| | Pages | | | |
| 12/27/05 | 245 | 36.75 | | |
| 12/28/05 | 223 | 33.45 | | |
| 12/28/05 | Copies: Bexar County Courthouse | 1.20 | | |
| 01/02/06 | 290 | 43.50 | | |
| 01/04/06 | 950 | 142.50 | | |
| 01/04/06 | Copies: Bexar County Courthouse | 22.00 | | |
| 01/05/06 | 177 | 26.55 | | |
| 01/09/06 | 6 | 0.90 | | |
| | | | TOTAL COPY CHARGES | 306.85 |
| PARKING | CHARGES | | | |
| 12/28/05 | Bexar County Courthouse | 10.00 | | |
| 01/05/06 | Bexar County Courthouse | 10.00 | | |
| 01/06/06 | Bexar County Courthouse | 10.00 | | |
| 01/06/06 | Bexar County Courthouse | 10.00 | | |
| | | | TOTAL PARKING CHARGES | 40.00 |
| FACSIMII | LE CHARGES | | | |
| 12/29/05 | | 3.00 | | |
| 01/02/06 | | 6.00 | | |
| 01/02/06 | | 5.00 | | |
| 01/03/06 | | 3.00 | | |

9.00

TOTAL FACSIMILE CHARGES

26.00

Mr. Andrew Kirch SOSDG/AHBL January 16, 2006 Page 6 of 7

ADDITIONAL CHARGES, continued:

| ADDITIO | VAL CHARGES, continuea: | | |
|----------|---|-------------------------------|--------|
| MEAL CH | IARGES | | |
| 01/04/06 | Dinner for Ms. Fischer and Ms. Tanner during preparation for Special Appearance Hearing | 32.82 | |
| 01/06/06 | Lunch at courthouse for Ms. Fischer and Ms. Tanner during Special Appearance Hearing | 13.57 | |
| | | TOTAL MEAL CHARGES | 46.39 |
| ONLINE I | RESEARCH CHARGES | | |
| ONLINE F | | | |
| 12/27/05 | WESTLAW Research Database | 75.83 | |
| 01/02/06 | WESTLAW Research Database | 82.78 | |
| 01/04/06 | MCF WESTLAW | 56.47 | |
| | Research Database | | |
| 01/04/06 | JT WESTLAW | 79.30 | |
| | Research Database | | |
| | | TOTAL ONLINE RESEARCH CHARGES | 294.38 |

TOTAL POSTAGE CHARGES 28.80

Mr. Andrew Kirch SOSDG/AHBL January 16, 2006 Page 7 of 7

| TOTAL ADDITIONAL CHARGES: | \$742.42 |
|---|-------------|
| TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES INCURRED THIS INVOICE | \$9,555.00 |
| TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED THIS INVOICE | \$10,297.42 |
| Payment Received 01/03/06- Thank You! 500 | .00 |
| Payment Received 01/03/06- Thank You! | .19 |
| Payment Received 01/03/06- Thank You! | .22 |
| Payment Received 01/05/06- Thank You! 3000 | .00 |
| Payment Received 01/05/06- Thank You! 383 | .10 |
| Payment Received 01/09/06- Thank You! 824 | .75 |
| Payment Received 01/12/06- Thank You! 169 | .62 |
| REMAINING BALANCE DUE | \$5,419.54 |